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Win High Value Construction
Work!
Skid Steer Loaders - Construction

Construction is a competitive and dynamic industry.
Specialized contract work can be high reward, high-risk
business. Smart contractors can secure the competitive edge
by upgrading their conventional Skid Steer Loaders and
support equipment through retro�tting - using RCT’s advanced
remote control systems.

Retro�tted remote-controlled loaders enable you to win
specialized work contracts and manage risks safely. Your
operators can remotely operate the loaders from a safe
distance at the job site, sending their machines in to complete
the dangerous work. Operators will be more con�dent and
productive each day, lifting machine billable hours.

Specialized work can include:Con�ned space work; Dam
building or repair; Land-�ll or rubbish management; Extreme
cold or heat material movement; Chemical salvage and
handling; Sea wall repairs; Product placement in snow, dust or
exposed to fumes; Drainage and �ood zones clearing; Silo
�ushing; Active power line work; Furnace cleaning and re-lining;
High altitude work; Toxic material movement; Sewerage
construction or clearage

Bene�ts: Win specialized contract work; Lift billable hours;
Protect your people; Multi task machines and operators;
Scalable options

Features

Line-of-Sight remote control (radio remote)

Teleremote (video)
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